ORDINANCE NO. 1106

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND REPLACING PARTS OF ARTICLE
3.100, SECTION 3.101 AND SECTION 3.102 OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF CITY OF LEVELLAND CODE AND ALL OTHER
ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF ANY ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT
THEREWITH; AMENDING CERTAIN SECTIONS BY ADOPTING THE
2021 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE AND
PROVIDING PARTICULAR LOCAL MODIFICATION THERETO;
PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; AND PROVIDING AN
EFFECTIVE DATE

WHEREAS, the City’s Code of Ordinances Chapter 3, Building & Construction, Article 3.100
Standard Codes, Section 3.101 provides for the adoption of International Building Code (2015
edition), International Residential Code (2015 edition), International Plumbing Code (2015 edition),
International Fuel Gas Code (2015 edition), International Mechanical Code (2015 edition),
International Energy Conservation Code, (2009 edition), International Property Maintenance Code,
(2015 edition), Life Safety Code (2015 edition), International Fire Code (2015 edition), National
Electrical Code (2014 edition), and the International Existing Building Code (2015 edition), with
certain local amendments provided for in Article 3.102; and

WHEREAS, the City Council now wishes to adopt the 2021 of the International Fuel Gas
Code, as published by the International Code Council, with certain local modifications as specified
herein; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds the following amendment to be reasonable and beneficial
and in the best interest of and best serves the public health, safety, and welfare of the residents of the
City of Levelland, Texas and will provide regulatory consistency for effective and meaningful
enforcement;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Levelland,
Texas that the Code of Ordinances is amended by repealing parts of Chapter 3, Building &
Construction, Article 3.100, Standard Codes, Sections 3.101 and 3.102, and replacing these Sections
to read, in part, as follows (note to codifier, the Section numbering may need to be revised):

SECTION I
General

§ 28.15.001. Adopted.

The 2021 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code, as published by the International Code
Council, Inc., as hereinafter amended, including appendices A, B, C and D, is hereby adopted as
the fuel gas code of the City of Levelland, Texas. A copy of said code is attached hereto and
incorporated herein as though set out herein in detail. References to the fuel gas code in this
chapter shall mean the 2021 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code. One copy of the 2021
International Fuel Gas Code shall be filed with the city secretary and a copy shall be maintained in the
office of the city building official. All such copies, with the amendments thereto, shall be open to public

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Fuel Gas Code Page |




inspection during the usual hours of business of the offices where they are maintained.

§ 28.15.002. Coordination of administrative provisions.

The administrative provisions contained in chapter 3 of this Code of Ordinances are applicable to this
article; however, for purposes of administering provisions related more specifically to the regulation
of fuel gas systems installation, these supplemental administrative provisions have been provided.
Except as amended or supplemented within sections 28.15.002 and 28.15.003, the entire text of chapter
1, of the 2021 International Fuel Gas Code is deemed to be incorporated herein as though set out herein
in detail. Where a conflict arises between a provision contained within sections 28.15.002 and
28.15.003 and chapter 3 of this Code of Ordinances, it is the intent that the more specific govern, as
determined by the building official.

§ 28.15.003. Intentionally omitted.

§ 28.15.004. Amendments.
(a) Sloped roofs. Section 306.5.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

306.5.1 Sloped roofs. Where appliances, equipment, fans or other components that require service
are installed on a roof having a slope of 6 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (50 percent slope)
or greater and having an edge more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade at such edge, a level
platform shall be provided on each side of the appliance or equipment to which access is required
for service, repair or maintenance. The platform shall be not less than 30 inches (762 mm) in any
dimension and shall be provided with guards. The guards shall extend not less than 42 inches
(1067 mm) above the platform, shall be constructed so as to prevent the passage of a 21-inch-
diameter (533 mm) sphere and shall comply with the loading requirements for guards specified
in the International Building Code. Access shall not require walking on roofs having a slope
greater than 6 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (50 percent slope). Where access involves
obstructions greater than 30 inches (762 mm) in height, such obstructions shall be provided with
ladders installed in accordance with Section 306.5 or stairways installed in accordance with the
requirements specified in the International Building Code in the path of travel to and from
appliances, fans or equipment requiring service.

(b) Auxiliary drain pan. Section 307.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

307.5 Auxiliary drain pan. Category IV condensing appliances shall be provided with an
auxiliary drain pan where damage to any building component will occur as a result of stoppage
in the condensate drainage system. Such pan will be installed in accordance with the applicable
provisions of Section 307 of the International Mechanical Code.

(c) Protection methods against corrosion.
Section 404.11.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

404.11.2 Protection methods. Underground piping shall comply with one or more of the
following:

1. The piping shall be made of corrosion-resistant material that is suitable for the
environment in which it will be installed.

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Fuel Gas Code Page 2




(d)

(e)

(f)
(2

(h)

2. Pipe shall have a factory-applied, electrically-insulating coating. Fittings and joints
between sections of coated pipe shall be coated in accordance with the coating manufacturer's
instructions.

3. The piping shall have a cathodic protection system installed and the system shall be
monitored and maintained in accordance with an approved program.

4.  Approved protective éoatings or wrap may be field installed if piping that has a factory-
applied, electrically-insulating coating is not readily available.

Located at manifold. Section 409.5.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

409.5.3 Located at manifold. Where the appliance shutoff valve is installed at a manifold, such
shutoff valve shall be located within 50 feet (15,240 mm) of the appliance served and shall
be readily accessible and permanently identified. The piping from the manifold to within 6 feet
(1829 mm) of the appliance shall be designed, sized and installed in accordance with Sections 401
through 408. Shutoff valves located within attic spaces shall not be considered readily accessible.

Pressure regulators. Section 410.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

410.1 Pressure regulators. A line pressure regulator shall be installed where the appliance is
designed to operate at a lower pressure than the supply pressure. Line gas pressure regulators shall
be listed as complying with ANSI Z21.80/CSA 6.22. Access shall be provided to pressure
regulators. Regulators shall be located near walkways or at an access point. Pressure regulators
shall be protected from physical damage. Regulators installed on the exterior of the building shall
be approved for outdoor installation.

Log lighters. Section 603 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Exhaust material. Section 614.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

614.4 Exhaust installation. Exhaust ducts for clothes dryers shall terminate on the outside of the
building and shall be equipped with a backdraft damper. Screens shall not be installed at the
duct termination. Ducts shall not be connected or installed with sheet metal screws or other
fasteners that will obstruct the flow. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not be connected to a vent
connector, vent or chimney. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not extend into or through
ducts or plenums unless properly sleeved with materials conforming to Section

602.2.1 of the International Mechanical Code (in the case of plenums), or with materials meeting
the requirements for class 0 or 1 duct materials (in the case of ducts). Backdraft dampers shall
not be required for vertical terminations through the roof.

Protection required. Section 614.8 is hereby amended to read as follows:

614.8 Protection required. Protective shield plates shall be placed where nails or screws from
finish or other work are likely to penetrate the clothes dryer exhaust duct. Shield plates shall be
placed on the finished face of all framing members where there is less than 1.25 inches (32 mm)
between the duct and the finished face of the framing member. Such shield plates shall have a
thickness of not less than 0.0575 inch (1.463 mm) (No. 16 gage). Such plates shall cover the area
of the duct where the member is notched or bored.

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Fuel Gas Code Page 3




SECTION 1II
Severability

The provisions of this ordinance are declared to be severable. If any section, sentence, clause or phrase
of the ordinance shall for any reason be held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent
jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining sections, sentences, clauses,
and phrases of this ordinance, but they shall remain in full force and effect; it being the legislative
intent that this ordinance shall remain in effect notwithstanding the validity of any part.

SECTION III
Effective Date

This Ordinance shall take effect immediately upon its adoption by the City Council and publication as
may be required by governing law.

SECTION IV
Open Meetings

It is hereby officially found and determined that the meeting at which this Ordinance is passed was
open to the public as required and that public notice of the time, place, and purpose of said meeting

was given as required by the Open Meetings Act, Chapter 551, Gov't. Code.

SECTION V
Provisions Cumulative

All other terms and provisions of the Levelland Code of Ordinances not in conflict herewith and not
hereby amended shall remain in full force and effect. The passage of this Ordinance shall repeal any
wording of any existing ordinance that conflicts with the wording of this Ordinance.

INTRODUCED, PASSED, and APPROVED on its first reading this 1% day of December, 2025.

PASSED, APPROVED, and ADOPTED on its second and final reading this 15th day of December,
2025.

CITY OF LEVELLAND, TEXAS

By:

Breann Buxkemper, Mayor

ATTEST:

Andréa Corley, TRMC
City Secretary

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Fuel Gas Code Page 4




ORDINANCE NO. 1107

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND REPLACING PARTS OF
ARTICLE 3.100, SECTION 3.101 AND SECTION 3.102 OF THE CODE
OF ORDINANCES OF CITY OF LEVELLAND CODE AND ALL
OTHER ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF ANY ORDINANCES IN
CONFLICT THEREWITH; AMENDING CERTAIN SECTIONS BY
ADOPTING THE 2021 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
MECHANICAL CODE AND PROVIDING PARTICULAR LOCAL
MODIFICATION THERETO; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY
CLAUSE; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE

WHEREAS, the City’s Code of Ordinances Chapter 3, Building & Construction, Article
3.100 Standard Codes, Section 3.101 provides for the adoption of International Building Code
(2015 edition), International Residential Code (2015 edition), International Plumbing Code (2015
edition), International Fuel Gas Code (2015 edition), International Mechanical Code (2015
edition), International Energy Conservation Code, (2009 edition), International Property
Maintenance Code, (2015 edition), Life Safety Code (2015 edition), International Fire Code (2015
edition), National Electrical Code (2014 edition), and the International Existing Building Code
(2015 edition), with certain local amendments provided for in Article 3.102; and

WHEREAS, the City Council now wishes to adopt the 2021 edition of the International
Mechanical Code, as published by the International Code Council, with certain local modifications
as specified herein; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds the following amendment to be reasonable and
beneficial and in the best interest of and best serves the public health, safety, and welfare of the
residents of the City of Levelland, Texas and will provide regulatory consistency for effective and
meaningful enforcement;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Levelland,
Texas that the Code of Ordinances is amended by repealing parts of Chapter 3, Building &
Construction, Article 3.100, Standard Codes, Sections 3.101 and 3.102, and replacing these
Sections to read, in part, as follows (note to codifier, the Section numbering may need to be
revised):

SECTION 1
General

§ 28.11.001. Adopted.

The 2021 edition of the International Mechanical Code, as published by the International Code
Council, Inc., as hereinafter amended, including appendix A, is hereby adopted as the mechanical
code of the City of Levelland, Texas. A copy of said code is attached hereto and incorporated herein
as though set out herein in detail. References to the mechanical code in this chapter or to "this
code" within this article shall mean and refer to the 2021 edition of the International Mechanical

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Mechanical Code Page 1




Code as amended herein. One copy of the 2021 International Mechanical Code shall be filed with
the city secretary and a copy shall be maintained in the office of the city building official. All such
copies, with the amendments thereto, shall be open to public inspection during the usual hours of
business of the offices where they are maintained.

§ 28.11.002. Coordination of administrative provisions.

The administrative provisions contained in chapter 3 of this Code of Ordinances are applicable to
this article; however, for purposes of administering provisions related more specifically to the
regulation of mechanical systems installation, these supplemental administrative provisions have
been provided. Except as amended or supplemented within sections 28.11 .002 and 28.11.003, the
entire text of chapter 1, of the 2021 International Mechanical Code is deemed to be incorporated
herein as though set out herein in detail. Where a conflict arises between a provision contained
within sections 28.11.002 and 28.11.003 and chapter 3 of this Code of Ordinances, it is the intent
that the more specific govern, as determined by the building official.

§ 28.11.003. Intentionally omitted.

§ 28.11.004. Amendments.

(a) Guards.
Section 304.11 is hereby amended to read as follows:

304.11 Guards. Guards shall be provided where various components that require service and
roof hatch openings are located within 10 feet (3048 mm) of a roof edge or open side of a
walking surface and such edge or open side is located more than 30 inches (762 mm) above
the floor, roof, or grade below. The guard shall extend not less than 30 inches (762 mm)
beyond each end of components that require service. The top of the guard shall be located not
less than 42 inches (1067 mm) above the elevated surface adjacent to the guard. The guard
shall be constructed so as to prevent the passage of a 21-inch-diameter (533 mm) sphere and
shall comply with the loading requirements for guards specified in the International Building
Code.

Exceptions:

1. Guards are not required where permanent fall arrest/restraint anchorage connector
devices that comply with ANSI/ASSE Z 359.1 are affixed for use during the entire
lifetime of the roof covering. The devices shall be re-evaluated for possible replacement
when the entire roof covering is replaced. The devices shall be placed not more than 10
feet (3048 mm) on center along hip and ridge lines and placed not less than 10 feet (3048
mm) from roof edges and the open sides of walking surfaces.

2. Guards are not required to be installed upon replacement of legally-installed pre-
existing rooftop appliances and equipment within existing rough openings that would
otherwise be subject to Section 304.11, provided that a fall hazard warning sign is
affixed to the service access side of the equipment.

(b) Sloped roofs. Section 306.5.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

306.5.1 Sloped roofs. Where appliances, equipment, fans or other components that require

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Mechanical Code Page 2




service are installed on a roof having a slope of six units vertical in 12 units horizontal (50
percent slope) or greater and having an edge more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade at
such edge, a level platform shall be provided on each side of the appliance or equipment 10
which access is required for service, repair or maintenance. The platform shall not be less
than 30 inches (762 mm) in any dimension and shall be provided with guards. The guards
shall extend not less than 42 inches above the platform, shall be constructed so as to prevent
the passage of a 21-inch diameter sphere and shall comply with the loading requirements for
guards specified in the International Building Code. Access shall not require walking on roofs
having a slope greater than 6 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (50 percent slope). Where
access involves obstructions greater than 30 inches in height, such obstructions shall be
provided with ladders installed in accordance with Section 306.5 or stairways installed in
accordance with the requirements specified in the International Building Code in the path of
travel to and from appliances, fans or equipment requiring service.

(c) Drain piping materials and sizing. Section 307.2.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

307.2.2 Drain piping materials and sizing. Components of the condensate disposal system
shall be ABS. cast-iron, copper and copper-alloy, CPVC, cross-linked polyethylene,
galvanized steel, PE-RT, polyethylene, polypropylene, PVC, or PVDF piping or tubing.
Components shall be selected for the pressure and temperature rating of the installation. Joints
and connections shall be made in accordance with the applicable provisions of Chapter 7 of
the International Plumbing Code relative to the material type. Condensate waste and drain
line shall not be less than 3/4 inch (19.1mm) pipe size. Where the drain pipes from more than
one unit are manifolded together for condensate drainage, the pipe or tubing shall be sized in
accordance with Table 307.2.2. Piping that is reduced in size from the drain pan connection
to a size that is in accordance with Table 307.2.2 must use eccentric fittings for the size
reduction in horizontal piping. If the size reduction occurs in vertical piping concentric
fittings may be used.

(d) Auxiliary and secondary drain systems.
Section 307.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

307.2.3 Auxiliary and secondary drain systems. In addition to the requirements of Section
307.2.1, where damage to any building components could occur as a result of overflow from
the equipment primary condensate removal system, one of the following auxiliary protection
methods shall be provided for each cooling coil or fuel-fired appliance that produces
condensate:

1. An auxiliary drain pan with a separate drain shall be provided under the coils on which
condensation will occur. The auxiliary pan drain shall discharge to a conspicuous point
of disposal to alert occupants in the event of a stoppage of the primary drain. The pan
shall have a minimum depth of 1-1/2 inches (38 mm), shall be not less than 3 inches (76
mm) larger than the unit, or the coil dimensions in width and length and shall be
constructed of corrosion-resistant material. Galvanized sheet steel pans shall have a
minimum thickness of not less than 0.0236 inch (0.6010 mm) (No. 24 gage).
Nonmetallic pans shall have a minimum thickness of not less than 0.0625 inch (1.6 mm).

2. A separate overflow drain line shall be connected to the drain pan provided with the
equipment. Such overflow drain shall discharge to a conspicuous point of disposal to

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Mechanical Code Page 3




(e)
®

€3]

(h)

(1)

alert occupants in the event of a stoppage of the primary drain. The overflow drain line
shall connect to the drain pan at a higher level than the primary drain connection.

3. An auxiliary drain pan without a separate drain line shall be provided under the coils on
which condensate will occur. Such pan shall be equipped with a water-level detection
device conforming to UL 508 that will shut off the equipment served prior to overflow
of the pan. The auxiliary drain pan shall be constructed in accordance with Item 1 of this
section.

Ductless mini-split system traps. Section 307.2.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Ventilation required. Section 401.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

401.2 Ventilation required. Every occupied space shall be ventilated by natural means in
accordance with Section 402 or by mechanical means in accordance with Section 403.

Local exhaust. Section 403.3.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

403.3.2.3 Local exhaust. Local exhaust systems shall be provided in kitchens, bathrooms and
toilet rooms and shall have the capacity to exhaust the minimum airflow rate determined in
accordance with Table 403.3.2.3.

Table 403.3.2.3 ;

~ Minimnhi Required Local Exhaust Rates for Group R-2, R-3, and R-4 Occupancies
Area {q be Exhausted Exhaust Rate Capacity
Kitchens 100 cfm intermittent or 25 cfm continuous
Bathrooms & toilet rooms 50 c¢fm intermittent or 20 cfm continuous

Exception: The normal operation of bathroom and toilet room exhaust fans, as well as kitchen
range hood fans shall be considered adequate to satisfy the intermittent exhaust rate
requirements without the addition of additional exhaust fans.

Exhaust installation. Section 504.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

504.4 Exhaust installation. Dryer exhaust ducts for clothes dryers shall terminate on the
outside of the building and shall be equipped with a back draft damper. Screens shall not be
installed at the duct termination. Ducts shall not be connected or installed with sheet metal
screws or other fasteners that will obstruct the exhaust flow. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall
not be connected to a vent connector, vent or chimney. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not
extend into or through ducts or plenums.

Exception: Back draft dampers shall not be required for vertical duct penetrations through
roofs.

Length identification. Section 504.9.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

504.9.5. Length identification. Where the exhaust duct is concealed within the building
construction and exceeds a total developed length of 35 feet, the equivalent length of the
exhaust duct shall be identified on a permanent label or tag. The label or tag shall be located

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Mechanical Code Page 4




within 6 feet of the exhaust duct connection.

(j) Common exhaust systems for clothes dryers in multi-story structures. Section 504.11 is
hereby amended to read as follows:

504.11. Common exhaust systems for clothes dryers located in multi-story structures. Where
a common multistory duct system is designed and installed to convey exhaust from multiple
clothes dryers, the construction of the system shall be in accordance with all of the following:

1. The shaft in which the duct is installed shall be constructed and fire-resistance rated as
required by the International Building Code.

2 Dampers shall be prohibited in the exhaust duct. Penetrations of the shaft and ductwork
shall be protected in accordance with Section 607.5.5, Exception 2.

3. Rigid metal ductwork shall be installed within the shaft to convey the exhaust. The
ductwork shall be constructed of sheet steel having a minimum thickness of 0.0187
inch (No. 26 gage) and in accordance with SMACNA Duct Construction Standards.

The ductwork within the shaft shall be designed and installed without offsets.
The exhaust fan motor design shall be in accordance with Section 503.2.
The exhaust fan motor shall be located outside of the airstream.

The exhaust fan shall run continuously.

® N o v ok

Exhaust fan operation shall be monitored in an approved location and shall initiate an
audible or visual signal when the fan is not in operation.

9. Makeup air shall be provided for the exhaust system.

10. A cleanout opening shall be located at the base of the shaft to proved access to the
duct to allow for cleaning and inspection. The finished opening shall be not less than
12 inches by 12 inches.

11.  Screens shall not be installed at the termination.

12, The common multi story duct system shall serve only clothes dryers and shall be
independent of other exhaust systems

(k) Return air openings.
Section 601.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

601.5 Return air openings. Return air openings for heating, ventilation and air-conditioning
systems shall comply with all of the following:

1. Openings shall not be located less than 10 feet (3048 mm) measured in any direction
from an open combustion chamber or draft hood of another appliance located in the
same room Or space.

2 Return air shall not be taken from a hazardous or insanitary location or a refrigeration
room as defined in this code.

3. The amount of return air taken from any room or space shall be not greater than the flow

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Mechanical Code Page 5




rate of supply air delivered to such room or space, except as necessary to make up air
from a space on a common system where drawing return air is prohibited.

4. Return and transfer openings shall be sized in accordance with the appliance or
equipment manufacturer's installation instructions, ACCA Manual D or the design of the
registered design professional.

5 Return air taken from one dwelling unit shall not be discharged into another dwelling
unit.

6. Taking return air from a crawl space shall not be accomplished through a direct
connection to the return side of a forced air furnace. Transfer openings in the crawl space
enclosure shall not be prohibited.

7 Return air shall not be taken from a closet, bathroom, toilet room, kitchen, garage, boiler
room, furnace room or unconditioned attic.

8 Return air shall not be taken from indoor swimming pool enclosures and associated deck
areas.

Exceptions:

1. Where the air from such spaces is dehumidified in accordance with Section 403.2.1,
Item 2.

2. Dedicated HVAC systems serving only such places.

Exceptions:

1. Taking return air from a kitchen is not prohibited where such return air openings
serve the kitchen and are located not less than 10 feet (3048mm) from the cooking
appliances.

2. Taking return air from a kitchen is not prohibited in a dwelling unit where the
kitchen and living spaces are in a single room and the cooking appliance 1is
clectric and located not less than 5 feet (1524mm) in any direction from the return
air intake opening.

3 Dedicated forced air systems serving only the garage shall not be prohibited from
obtaining return air from the garage.

(1) Access port protection. Section 1102.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1II
Severability

The provisions of this ordinance are declared to be severable. If any section, sentence, clause or
phrase of the ordinance shall for any reason be held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining sections,
sentences, clauses, and phrases of this ordinance, but they shall remain in full force and effect; it
being the legislative intent that this ordinance shall remain in effect notwithstanding the validity
of any part.

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Mechanical Code Page 6




SECTION III
Effective Date

This Ordinance shall take effect immediately upon its adoption by the City Council and publication
as may be required by governing law.

SECTION IV
Open Meetings

It is hereby officially found and determined that the meeting at which this Ordinance is passed was
open to the public as required and that public notice of the time, place, and purpose of said meeting
was given as required by the Open Meetings Act, Chapter 551, Gov't. Code.

SECTION V
Provisions Cumulative

All other terms and provisions of the Levelland Code of Ordinances not in conflict herewith and
not hereby amended shall remain in full force and effect. The passage of this Ordinance shall
repeal any wording of any existing ordinance that conflicts with the wording of this Ordinance.

INTRODUCED, PASSED, and APPROVED on its first reading this 1% day of December, 2025.

PASSED, APPROVED, and ADOPTED on its second and final reading this 15th day of
December, 2025.

CITY OF LEVELLAND/,7TEXAS

v NN TN L

v ~ /
Breann Buxkemper, Mayor V(’L/k

ITEST:

O Ledbiey
Andréa Corley, TRMC 7/
City Secretary

Ordinance Adopting 2021 International Mechanical Code Page 7




